
The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, 
national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation.  Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO 

Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities 
(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

REVISED: 5/19/2017 

REVISED 
RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

ITB #: 19-122E Tentative Board Meeting Date*: JULY 23, 2019 

ITB Title: Filemaker Pro Database Licensing Maintenance # Notified: 389 # Downloaded: 9 

# of Responses Rec’d: 4 # of “No Bids”: 0 

For: Information & Technology ITB Opening Date : MAY 24, 2019 
(School/Department)

Fund: I&T Operating Budget Advertised Date: MAY 7, 2019  

POSTING OF ITB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: ITB Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement & 
Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on JUNE 13, 2019_@ 3:00 pm and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person who is adversely 
affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decision or intended 
decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a notice of protest or 
failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that “The 
formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays and days during 
which the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of 
Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action protesting 
an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward 
County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy 
3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest. 

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD BID, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC. The Board meeting 
date stated above is tentative. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.  

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

IN ORDER TO MEET THE NEEDS OF SBBC, THIS BID SHALL BE AWARDED BY GROUP IN ITS ENTIRETY TO THE LOWEST 
RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEETING ALL SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS AND CONDITIONS. 

 VENDOR NAME AWARD 

 DATABASE DEVELOPMENT SERVICES, INC. GROUP 2 

GROUP 2 WAS SELECTED OVER GROUPS 1 AND 3 AS THE OPTION IN THE BEST INTEREST OF SBBC. 

CONTRACT TERM: UPON BOARD APPROVAL AND CONCLUDING THREE (3) YEARS LATER WITH AN OPTION FOR TWO 
(2) ADDITIONAL ONE (1) YEAR RENEWAL PERIODS .

June 12, 2019 
By: Date: 

(Purchasing Agent) 

Page 1 of 3



Bid No: 19-122E

Title of Bid: Filemaker Pro Database License Maintenance

Purchasing Agent Name: Harmoni Clealand

Bid Opening Date: May 24, 2019

Proposer's Name Recommended for Award

Database Development Services, Inc 
GovConnection, Inc. d/b/a Connection Public Sector Solutions
inSTAFF Solutions, LLC d/b/a IT Data Solutions
United Data Technologies d/b/a UDT

REVISED TABULATION SUMMARY SHEET

GROUP 2
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 Database 
Development 
Services, Inc 

 GovConnection, Inc. 
d/b/a Connection Public 

Sector Solutions 

 inSTAFF Solutions, 
LLC d/b/a IT Data 

Solutions 

 United Data 
Technologies d/b/a 

UDT 

 No  No  Yes  Yes 

$238,052.52 $245,752.60 $534,454.30 $264,554.20

5% $0.00 $0.00 -$26,722.72 -$13,227.71

$238,052.52 $245,752.60 $507,731.59 $251,326.49

$238,052.52 $245,752.60 $684,768.84 $264,554.20

5% $0.00 $0.00 -$34,238.44 -$13,227.71

$238,052.52 $245,752.60 $650,530.40 $251,326.49

$589,887.50 $612,612.96 $991,357.00 $646,265.00

5% $0.00 $0.00 -$49,567.85 -$32,313.25

$589,887.50 $612,612.96 $941,789.15 $613,951.75

$589,887.50 $612,612.96 $1,237,384.26 $646,265.00

5% $0.00 $0.00 -$61,869.21 -$32,313.25

$589,887.50 $612,612.96 $1,175,515.05 $613,951.75

$673,264.20 $655,040.74

5% $0.00 -$32,752.04

$673,264.20 $622,288.70

$673,264.20 $655,040.74

5% $0.00 -$32,752.04

$673,264.20 $622,288.70

Bidder Name --->

PRICE ANALYSIS

Bid # 19-122E

Title of Bid: Filemaker Pro Database License Maintenance

FLORIDA STATE BIDDER--->

ORIGINAL GROUP 1A TOTAL

GROUP 2B

GROUP 2B TOTAL

GROUP 3A

GROUP 1A

GROUP 1A TOTAL

GROUP 1B

GROUP 1B TOTAL

GROUP 2A

GROUP 2A TOTAL

Florida Bidder Pref

ORIGINAL GROUP 1B TOTAL

Florida Bidder Pref

ORIGINAL GROUP 2A TOTAL

Florida Bidder Pref

Florida Bidder Pref

Florida Bidder Pref

Florida Bidder Pref

ORIGINAL GROUP 3B TOTAL

ORIGINAL GROUP 2B TOTAL

ORIGINAL GROUP 3A TOTAL

GROUP 3B

No Bid No Bid

GROUP 3B TOTAL

No Bid No Bid

GROUP 3A TOTAL
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